
 

Hosea Sanga      
Dar es Salaam, 

TANZANIA 
Cellphone: +255 713 456 779   

Email: hoseasanga@gmail.com  
 

 
Hosea Sanga       
 
 
Professional Summary 
 

Hosea S. Sanga is a member of the Tanzania Water Partnership (TWP) core team. He holds a 
Master Degree in Geo-information Science and Earth Observation specialization in Water 
Resources and Environmental Management from International institute for Geo-information 
Science and Earth Observation (ITC), The Netherlands. Mr. Sanga is a Founder and Director 
of a consulting firm - Upscale Innovations Company Limited which deals with Water 
Resources Development and Environmental Management. Mr. Sanga also holds a BSc. in 
Geology from the University of Dar es Salaam and has worked with Water Witness 
International (WWI), International Union Conservation for Nature (IUCN) and as a Local 
Consultant for the iMoMo (innovations monitoring and modelling for better Wáter 
Resources) consulting firm under the SADC funded Project in the Pangani river Basin. During 
his tenure with IUCN, he worked as a Project Officer for the Pangani River basin Project, 
based in Moshi. His tasks in the IUCN’s lead project included providing leadership and 
testing, demonstrating and informing water resource management policy and practice, 
developing and implementing an effective monitoring and evaluation plan for IUCN’s work in 
Pangani Basin with a strong focus on measuring and delivering conservation and livelihood 
outcomes.  Mr. Sanga has also worked with the Ministry of Water at various capacities for 
eight years. While at the Ministry of Water, he played a key role in establishing and 
implementing a Water Sector Development Program as a Water Resources Expert.  Mr. 
Sanga participated in the review and development of all the major management tools in the 
water sector such as the Water Resources Management Act (2009), the Water Sector 
Development Strategy, and the Water Sector Capacity Building Strategy. 
 


